

EXHIBIT 24

Detailed Time Entry Report

Date	Description	Hours	Name	Rate	Total Cost
01/24/17	Correspondence with counsel for Charlie and Frank Ferrara regarding failure to produce call logs and text messages.	0.3	Wolff, Samantha	\$525	\$157.50
02/01/17	Correspondence with counsel for Charlie and Frank Ferrara regarding failure to produce call logs and text messages.	0.3	Wolff, Samantha	\$525	\$157.50
02/08/17	Correspondence with counsel for Charlie and Frank Ferrara regarding failure to produce call logs and text messages.	0.3	Wolff, Samantha	\$525	\$157.50
02/10/17	Correspondence with counsel for Charlie and Frank Ferrara regarding failure to produce call logs and text messages.	0.1	Wolff, Samantha	\$525	\$52.50
03/01/17	Review correspondence from counsel for Charlie and Frank Ferrara pertaining to failure to produce cell phone data.	0.1	Wolff, Samantha	\$525	\$52.50
04/14/17	Prepare and send communication to counsel for Charlie and Frank Ferrara regarding deficient discovery responses.	0.8	Wolff, Samantha	\$525	\$420.00
04/17/17	Correspondence with counsel for Charlie and Frank Ferrara regarding deficient discovery responses.	0.8	Wolff, Samantha	\$525	\$420.00
04/21/17	Prepare for and attend telephonic meet and confer with Tiffany Bacon regarding Charlie and Frank Ferrara's failure to respond to discovery.	1.9	Wolff, Samantha	\$525	\$997.50
05/01/17	Communication with Tiffany Bacon regarding outstanding discovery issues.	1	Wolff, Samantha	\$525	\$525.00
06/27/17	Prepare meet and confer letter to counsel for Charlie and Frank Ferrara regarding discovery.	2.5	Wolff, Samantha	\$525	\$1,312.50
06/30/17	Review communication from Tiffany Bacon regarding discovery dispute.	0.1	Wolff, Samantha	\$525	\$52.50
07/03/17	Prepare for and attend telephonic meet and confer with Tiffany Bacon regarding Charlie and Frank Ferrara's failure to respond to discovery.	1	Wolff, Samantha	\$525	\$525.00

Detailed Time Entry Report

Date	Description	Hours	Name	Rate	Total Cost
07/10/17	Review discovery responses from Charlie and Frank Ferrara to identify deficiencies in production responses. Communication with Defendants' counsel regarding lack of document production and communication with Magistrate to set hearing regarding same.	1.9	Wolff, Samantha	\$525	\$997.50
07/11/17	Communication with opposing counsel for Charlie and Frank Ferrara regarding discovery dispute.	0.2	Wolff, Samantha	\$525	\$105.00
07/12/17	Meet and confer with counsel for Charlie and Frank Ferrara regarding Plaintiffs' intent to file MSJ notwithstanding incomplete discovery responses and Plaintiffs' intent to file FRCP 56(d) motion in response based on deficient discovery responses. Prepare for hearing regarding discovery.	2.7	Wolff, Samantha	\$525	\$1,417.50
07/13/17	Prepare for and attend hearing regarding Charlie and Frank Ferrara's failure to comply with discovery order.	3.4	Wolff, Samantha	\$525	\$1,785.00
07/18/17	Prepare letter to counsel for Charlie and Frank Ferrara regarding production deficiency. Prepare communication to clerk regarding discovery dispute. Communication with counsel for Charlie and Frank Ferrara regarding dispute.	1.5	Wolff, Samantha	\$525	\$787.50
07/24/17	Meet and confer with counsel for Charlie and Frank Ferrara regarding discovery dispute.	0.6	Wolff, Samantha	\$525	\$315.00
07/25/17	Prepare for and attend telephonic hearing with Magistrate Judge regarding Charlie and Frank Ferrara's deficient discovery responses.	1.1	Wolff, Samantha	\$525	\$577.50
07/26/17	Prepare for and attend hearing regarding deficiencies in Charlie and Frank Ferrara's discovery.	1.1	Wolff, Samantha	\$525	\$577.50

Detailed Time Entry Report

Date	Description	Hours	Name	Rate	Total Cost
08/02/17	Review transcript of recent hearing to prepare for drafting sanctions motion.	0.8	O'Connor, Laurel	\$325	\$260.00
08/03/17	Research re local rules and standards for sanctions motions.	1.9	O'Connor, Laurel	\$325	\$617.50
08/06/17	Review factual evidence to support sanctions motion. Begin drafting motion for sanctions against Charlie and Frank Ferrara and their counsel.	5.4	O'Connor, Laurel	\$325	\$1,755.00
08/07/17	Draft MPA ISO motion for sanctions.	3.9	O'Connor, Laurel	\$325	\$1,267.50
08/08/17	Revise MPA ISO motion for monetary sanctions. Draft declaration ISO motion for monetary sanctions. Draft proposed order re monetary sanctions.	6.2	O'Connor, Laurel	\$325	\$2,015.00
08/09/17	Revise and finalize MPA ISO motion for sanctions and declaration, notice of motion and motion, and proposed order re same.	2.5	O'Connor, Laurel	\$325	\$812.50
08/09/17	Review and revise MPA ISO motion for sanctions. Research regarding same.	11.2	Wolff, Samantha	\$525	\$5,880.00
08/10/17	Further revise and finalize MPA ISO motion for sanctions. Revise declaration in support. Prepare exhibits to declaration.	10.4	Wolff, Samantha	\$525	\$5,460.00
08/11/17	Revise and finalize declaration, exhibits and MPA ISO motion for sanctions.	2.1	Wolff, Samantha	\$525	\$1,102.50
	Grand Total	66.1			\$30,562.50